Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Colleen D. Anderson

Purchasing Manager
BID PROJECT: Lawn Care Products

BID PROJECT #: 0203-23

BID DATE: February 22, 2023 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #: | Phil DiFrancesco, ¥  585-753-1130

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID
Group A $83,532.68 CORRECTED
Andre & Son Inc Group B $24,935.00 NOT COMPLETED
17150 SR 706 Group C $8,567.00  NOT COMPLETED
Montrose, PA 18801 Group D NO BID

Group E $1,675.00

Group F 35,016.75 NOT COMPLETED
Group G $13,324.90

Group H §7,940.00 NOT COMPLETED
Group A $71,985.25 NOT COMPLETED
Group B NO BID

First Turf & Ornamental Group C $10,953.85
3349 Monroe Ave #290 Group D NO BID
Rochester, NY 14618 Group E $1,481.25

Group F $1,551.65 CORRECTED
Group G $13,999.12 CORRECTED
Group H NO BID

Group A $75,459.05

Group B $33,146.33

Nutrien AG Solutions Group C $9,604.30
1173 Pittsford-Victor Rd Group D $3,986.42
Pittsford, NY 14534 Group E $1,454 80

Group F $1,433.01
Group G 513,096.66
Group H $14,522.48




