

Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ● 39 West Main Street ● Rochester, NY 14614 Colleen D. Anderson **Purchasing Manager** 

BID PROJECT:	Food & Food Service Supplies	
BID PROJECT #:	205-23	
BID DATE:	March 9, 2023	11:00 a.m.
BUYER & PHONE #:	Phil DiFrancesco,	585-753-1130

## THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR	AMOUNT BID
	Group 1 NO BID
Hill & Markes, LLC.	Group 2 NO BID
1997 St. Hwy. 55	Group 3 NO BID
Amsterdam, NY 12010	Group 4 NO BID
	<b>Group 5</b> \$2,664.90
	Group 6 \$165.39
	Group 1 \$1,014.00
JFS Curtze	Group 2 \$6,358.11
15 Airline Drive	Group 3 \$3880,70
Rochester, NY 14624	Group 4 \$5,069.53 CORRECTED & INCOMPLETE
	Group 5 \$3532.64 INCOMPLETE
	Group 6 \$202.80
	Group 1 NO BID
Plastic Express Inc.	Group 2 NO BID
667 Lehigh Ave.	Group 3 NO BID
Union, NJ 07083	Group 4 NO BID
	Group 5 \$3,421.08
	Group 6 \$261.15
	Group 1 \$953.34
Sysco Syracuse	Group 2 \$12,209.84
2508 Warners Rd	Group 3 \$4,061.84
Warners N. Y. 13164	Group 4 \$11,986.10 CORRECTED
	Group 5 \$4,748.53 CORRECTED
	Group 6 \$175.74