Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: Monroe County City Place Space Utilization Renovation - Furniture, Fixtures
and Equipment

BID PROJECT #: 0210-23
BID DATE: April 11, 2023 2:00 pm
BUYER & PHONE #: | Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 ,<_.\]\)

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND
DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Contract C-1 _$203,981.63 *corrected total

Design Space Studios, LLC
135 Sully’s Trail Suite 12 Contract C-2 _No Bid
Pittsford, NY 14534

Contract C-3 _$143,704.36 *corrected total

Contract C-4 _No Bid

Contract C-5 _ No Bid

Contract C-6 _$61,703.94 *corrected total

NG-1 No Bid

NG-2 No Bid
NG-3 No Bid
NG-4 No Bid
NG-5 No Bid

NG-6.1 ___No Bid

NG-6.2 __No Bid

NG-6.3 __No Bid

NG-7 No Bid

NG-8 No Bid

NG-9 No Bid

NG-10 No Bid

NG-11.1 _No Bid

NG-11.2___No Bid




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: Monroe County City Place Space Utilization Renovation — Furniture, Fixtures
and Equipment

BID PROJECT #: 0210-23
BID DATE: April 11, 2023 2:00 pm
BUYER & PHONE #: | Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 %\)\)

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND
DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID
- Contract C-1 _$149,324.89
Intivity, Inc.
106 Despatch Drive Contract C-2 _$14,880.06 *corrected total
Suite 2 Contract C-3 _$117,609.32 *corrected total
East Rochester, NY 14445
Contract C-4 _$476,416.83 *corrected total

Contract C-5 _$69,495.35

Contract C-6 _$51,229.39

NG-1 $2,417.10

NG-2 __ $2,729.40

NG-3 No Bid

NG-4 $3.625.71

NG-5 $1,108.47

NG-6.1 ___$3,984.30

NG-6.2 __$3,460.80

NG-6.3  $11,789.95 *corrected total

NG-7 No Bid

NG-8 $8,099.56

NG-9 $5,670.50

NG-10 $985.00

NG-11.1 $7.724.73 *corrected total

NG-11.2 __ $3082.76




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614

Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: Monroe County City Place Space Utilization Renovation — Furniture, Fixtures
and Equipment

BID PROJECT #: 0210-23

BID DATE: April 11, 2023 2:00 pm

BUYER & PHONE #: | Sean Wilcox,

585-753-1136

N

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND
DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR

AMOUNT BID

Sedgwick Business Interiors, LLC
176 Anderson Avenue
Rochester, NY 14607

Contract C-1 _$131,240.47

Contract C-2 _No Bid

Contract C-3 _No Bid

Contract C-4 _No Bid

Contract C-5 _No Bid

Contract C-6 __No Bid

NG-1 No Bid
NG-2 No Bid
NG-3 No Bid
NG-4 No Bid
NG-5 No Bid
NG-6.1 __No Bid
NG-6.2 ___No Bid
NG-6.3 ___No Bid
NG-7 No Bid
NG-8 No Bid
NG-9 No Bid
NG-10 No Bid
NG-11.1 __No Bid
NG-11.2 __ No Bid




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: Monroe County City Place Space Utilization Renovation — Furniture, Fixtures
and Equipment

BID PROJECT #: 0210-23
BID DATE: April 11, 2023 2:00 pm
BUYER & PHONE #: | Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 g\]\)

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND
DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Contract C-1 _$142,949.16

Workplace Interiors of Buffalo
815 Hillside Avenue Contract C-2 _$9249.85
Rochester, NY 14618

Contract C-3 _$112,419.62

Contract C-4 _$389,802.67 *corrected total

Contract C-5 $93,160.94 *corrected total

Contract C-6 _$34,968.89

NG-1 $2,027.04

NG-2 $1.681.38

NG-3 No Bid

NG-4 No Bid

NG-5 No Bid

NG-6.1 ___No Bid

NG-6.2 __No Bid

NG-6.3 ___No Bid

NG-7 No Bid

NG-8 $8.541.19

NG-9 $3,437.84

NG-10 $674.40

NG-11.1 __$2,737.50

NG-11.2___ $1.825.00




