

Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ● 39 West Main Street ● Rochester, NY 14614 Colleen D. Anderson **Purchasing Manager**

BID PROJECT:	Snowplowing and Salting Services			
BID PROJECT #:	0912-24			
BID DATE:	October 8, 2024	2:00 pm		
BUYER & PHONE #:	Sean Wilcox,	585-753-1136	24)	

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD

AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.			
NAME OF VENDOR (ALPHABETICALLY)	AMOUNT BID		
Bedford Paving 271 Paul Road Rochester, NY 14624	Group 1: No Bid Group 3A: \$3,237.00 Group 3B: No Bid Group 5B: \$2,596.00 Group 7: No Bid		
Cardinal Lawn & Landscape Inc. 5112 W Ridge Road Spencerport, NY 14559	Group 1:\$3,710.00 Group 3A: _\$2,270.00 Group 3B: _\$490.00 Group 5B:No Bid Group 7:No Bid		
Green Dreams Development 1151 Shoecraft Road Webster, NY 14580	Group 1: \$3,295.00 Group 3A: \$4,005.00 Group 3B: \$575.00 Group 5B: No Bid Group 7: \$3,650.00		
PropertyCare A Josh Landscape Co. 106 W. Main Street Honeoye Falls, NY 14472	Group 1: \$1795.64 Corrected Total Group 3A: \$2319.56 Corrected Total Group 3B: \$580.97 Corrected Total Group 5B: \$1766.79 Corrected Total Group 7: \$2065.90 Corrected Total		
SCC Services, Inc. 96 Bailey Road W. Henrietta, NY 14586	Group 1: No Bid Group 3A: \$5,099.00 Group 3B: \$1,015.00 Group 5B: \$1,712.00 Corrected Total Group 7: No Bid		