Purchasing & Central Services

County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614

Colieen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT:

Monroe Community College ATC Building Furniture, Fixtures, and
Equipment

BID PROJECT #:

0901-25

BID DATE:

Tuesday, October 28, 2025 11:00 am. —~

BUYER & PHONE #:

Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 ‘—)QQ

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

LISTED ALPHABETICALLY

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Contract C-1 $205,833.30

EM&N Marketing, Inc. Contract C-2 $81,663.69
DBA
Quality Office Envircnments Contract C-3 NO BID

127 Main Street

Geneseo, NY 14454 Contract C-4 NO BID

Contract C-5 $398,023.25

Contract C-6 NO BID

Contract C-7 NO BID

Contract C-8 NO BID

Contract C-9 NO BID

Contract C-10 NO BID

Contract C-11 NO BID




Purchasing & Central Services

County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614

Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT:

Monroe Community College ATC Building Furniture, Fixtures, and
Equipment

BID PROJECT #:

0901-25

BID DATE:

Tuesday, October 28, 2025 11:00 a.m. ~

BUYER & PHONE #:

/‘
Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 "?:NQ\‘!

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

LISTED ALPHABETICALLY

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID
Contract C-1 $195,006.35
Intivity Contract C-2 $77,239.71 CORRECTED TOTAL

106 Despatch Drive, Suite 2
East Rochester, NY 14445

Contract C-3 $99,483.05

Contract C-4 $75,322.65
Contract C-5 $407.878.17 CORRECTED TOTAL
Contract C-6 $20,932.70

Contract C-7 NO BID

Contract C-8 $52 785.96

Contract C-9 $1.388.23

Contract C-10 $1.228.74
Contract C-11 $363.92




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614

Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: Monroe Community College ATC Building Furniture, Fixtures, and
Equipment

BID PROJECT #: 0901-25

BID DATE: Tuesday, October 28, 2025 11:00 a.m. p— )

BUYER & PHONE #: Sean Wilcox, 585-753-1136 :\—}\N |

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

LISTED ALPHABETICALLY

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Workplace Interiors

Contract C-1 $230,718.02 CORRECTED TOTAL

Contract C-2 $95,332.89

10 Carlson Road Contract C-3 $124.547.14 CORRECTED TOTAL

Rochester, NY 14610

Contract C-4 NO BID

Contract C-5 $472,546.85 CORRECTED TOTAL

Contract C-6 NO BID

Contract C-7 NO BID

Contract C-8 NO BID

Contract C-9 NO BID

Contract C-10 NO BID

Contract C-11 NO BID




