Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Dawn C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT: MCC Building 2 Renovation Phase | Project — General Construction
BID PROJECT #: BP0902-17
BID DATE: October 11,2017 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #: | Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID
. Total Base Bid $233,000.00
Testa Construction, Inc Add Alt e #1 $13.200.00
12 Industrial Park Circle Add Altemate 4 $12’200'00
Rochester, NY 14624 ernate <
Add Alternate #3 $11,500.00
Add Alternate #4 $4,000.00

. . Total Base Bid $246,900.00
Kuitems Construction, Inc. Add Alt to #1 $14.800.00
1287 North Clinton Avenue Add Altemate 4 $13’300'00
Rochester, NY 14621 ernate 008

Add Alternate #3 $15,500.00

Add Alternate #4 No Bid
Cmens s
315 Alexander Street ernate ' ’

. Add Alternate #2 $11,700.00
Suite 301 Add Alt te #3 $19,300.00
Rochester, NY 14604 ernate U8,

Add Alternate #4 $6,100.00
Total B Bi 257 .
D’Agostino General Contractors, Inc otal Base Bid $257,500.00
. Add Alternate #1 $15,300.00
803 Linden Avenue Add Alt te #2 $15,100.00
Rochester, NY 14625 ernate ' '
Add Alternate #3 $10,900.00
Add Alternate #4 $7,700.00
. Total Base Bid $275,000.00
Javen Construction Co., Inc. Add Alt to #1 $15.200.00
2575 Baird Road Add Altemate #2 $14,900.00
Penfield, NY 14526 ernate 5008
Add Alternate #3 $13,900.00
Add Alternate #4 $4,000.00




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Dawn C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT: MCC Building 2 Renovation Phase | Project — General Construction
BID PROJECT #: BP0902-17
BID DATE: October 11,2017 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #: | Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Total Base Bid $294,000.00
Add Alternate #1 $16,000.00
Add Alternate #2 $15,800.00
Add Alternate #3 $14,900.00
Add Alternate #4 $7,300.00

Holdsworth Klimowski Construction, Inc.
101 Victor Heights Parkway
Victor, NY 14564

Total Base Bid $310,000.00
Add Alternate #1 $12,500.00
Add Alternate #2 $13,000.00
Add Alternate #3 $12,500.00
Add Alternate #4 $5,000.00

DiPasquale Construction
5138 W. Ridge Road
Spencerport, NY 14559




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Dawn C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT:

MCC Building 2 Renovation Phase | Project — Electrical Construction

BID PROJECT #: BP0902-17

BID DATE: October 11, 2017

11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #:

Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING

AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR

AMOUNT BID

Callea Electric, Inc.
40 Ajax Road
Rochester, NY 14624

Total Base Bid

Add Alternate #1
Add Alternate #2
Add Alternate #3
Add Alternate #4

$117,400.00
$7,500.00
$6,900.00
$5,100.00
$1,000.00

Concord Electric Corp.
705 Maple Street
Rochester, NY 14611

Total Base Bid

Add Alternate #1
Add Alternate #2
Add Alternate #3
Add Alternate #4

$128,000.00
$9,000.00
$9,000.00
$5,000.00
$1,200.00

North Coast Electrical Solutions, LLC
30 Grace Marie Drive
Webster, NY 14580

Total Base Bid

Add Alternate #1
Add Alternate #2
Add Alternate #3
Add Alternate #4

$130,800.00
$7,970.00
$7,222.00
$2,616.00
$1,130.00

Blackmon-Farrell Electric, Inc.
57 Halstead Street
Rochester, NY 14610

Total Base Bid

Add Alternate #1
Add Alternate #2
Add Alternate #3
Add Alternate #4

$134,250.00
$8,100.00
$7,400.00
$3,250.00
$1,250.00

Northeastern Electrical
35 Regency Oaks Blvd.
Rochester, NY 14624

Total Base Bid

Add Alternate #1
Add Alternate #2
Add Alternate #3
Add Alternate #4

$157,500.00
$7,100.00
$7,000.00
$3,700.00
$1,550.00




Purchasing & Central Services

County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614

Dawn

C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT:

MCC Building 2 Renovation Phase | Project — Electrical Construction

BID PROJECT #:

BP0902-17

BID DATE:

October 11, 2017 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #:

Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR

AMOUNT BID

Hewitt Young Electric, LLC

645 Maple Street
Rochester, NY 14611

Total Base Bid $159,252.00
Add Alternate #1 $3,500.00
Add Alternate #2 $3,700.00
Add Alternate #3 $3,500.00
Add Alternate #4 $2,000.00




Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Dawn C. Staub, Purchasing Manager, (585) 753-1100

BID PROJECT:

MCC Building 2 Renovation Phase | Project — Mechanical Construction

BID PROJECT #:

BP0902-17

BID DATE:

October 11, 2017 11:00 am

BUYER & PHONE #:

Sharon A. Berndt, (585) 753-1110

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR

AMOUNT BID

Landry Mechanical Contractors, Inc.

164 Flint Hill Road
LeRoy, NY 14482

Total Base Bid $33,400.00
Add Alternate #1 $3,000.00
Add Alternate #2 $1,600.00
Add Alternate #3 No Bid

Add Alternate #4 $13,300.00

Crosby-Brownlie, Inc.
100 Nassau Street
Rochester, NY 14605

Total Base Bid $39,990.00
Add Alternate #1 $4,000.00
Add Alternate #2 $1,600.00
Add Alternate #3 No Bid

Add Alternate #4 $15,300.00

Pipitone Enterprises, LLC
25 East Buffalo Street
Churchville, NY 14428

Total Base Bid $46,000.00
Add Alternate #1 $2,900.00
Add Alternate #2 $1,300.00
Add Alternate #3 No Bid

Add Alternate #4 $14,600.00

Willett Builders, Inc.
180 Genesee Street
Corfu, NY 14036

Total Base Bid $69,000.00
Add Alternate #1 $9,500.00
Add Alternate #2 $2,100.00
Add Alternate #3 No Bid

Add Alternate #4 $18,500.00
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